
Journey with the Oracle Inner Realm Agreements 

*GUIDELINES for Our Journey with the Oracle Inner Realm*

PLEASE Read & Agree prior to entering the Inner Realm container


Welcome Beautiful Soul Spirit, to the Journey with the Oracle Inner Realm where we Share & 
Connect as a Community of Journey with the Oracle. To be witnessed, held & supported in a 
judgement & shame free space. You are honored, supported and welcomed here. 


These guidelines & agreements are to set and hold a sacred container for all the Journey 
with the Oracle Inner Realm spaces, from our online portal to our Inner Realm Musings 
private & public space on Telegram to our Oracle and New Moon gatherings.


A Strong container supports our transformational journeys. 
We are co-creating this field of love, truth and support. 

We are here to connect as a community sharing insights, authenticity, questions and 
inspiration related to the downloads & messages on our Oracle Journeys from our Guides & 
Intuition, Moon Cycles, Womb Wisdom & Power, Divine Feminine & Masculine Energies & 
Empowerment, Sacred Leadership, Earth Wisdom and Heart Truth.


Let us enter this space mindfully coming from a deep place of light and love in all our 
interactions here.  

1. Be Responsible ~ I take responsibility for my experience as a co-creator of this group

container. 


2. Be Committed ~ I take responsibility and commit to my own personal & spiritual inner 
journey and growth along the way and look for synchronicities.


3. Be Real ~ I hold myself with openness, integrity and full authenticity with honesty, 
kindness & radical acceptance & respect of myself and others at all times. I bring my open 
mind and heart, speak and act upon the truth of my own experience. 


4. Be Trustable ~ I agree to confidentiality and sacredness. Holding the identity and 
experiences of others in confidence. I do not share the teachings or insights of other women 
outside the group.




5. Be Inclusive ~ within this sacred space that honors and celebrates all diversity & life.


6. Be Supportive ~ We agree to witness, honor and be supportive of each other. 

Not offering advice or coaching but will offer reflections when and if invited to do so.


7. Be Generous ~ I give my support and energy to our journey and my attention to others. I 
allow myself to be in the mystery of the experience and allow it to unfold.


8. Be Present ~ I agree to be present in mind, body, heart & soul as well with as all my 
senses and practice deep listening, loving kindness & empathy at all times.


I, ___________________(State your name), Agree honor these agreements & guidelines while 
sharing and interacting in Journeying with the Oracle Inner Realm

And so it is. And so it is. And so it is. 


I am Grateful for your understanding & cooperation of these guidelines in creating a safe, 
supportive, loving space for us all.


Free free to reach out with any questions to: karen@firemoongoddess.studio 


As always so much Peace & Love 

KarenElizabeth 🔥 🌓 💃 


*GUIDELINES FOR THINGS TO SHARE HERE*

Please share Insights, Revelations, Synchronicities, Journaling Reflections and Experiences 
with Journeying. Love, notes, inspiration, heart sharing and challenges or questions you may 
need support around.


As a Reminder, ALL Original Artwork and Journey with the Oracle Content are the Copyrights 
of Karen Balon Art© & Fire Moon Goddess Studio LLC. Journey with the Oracle and the 
Artwork is for personal use. Please respect these copyrights. Please do not share or 
download without prior written permission from Karen Balon Art and Fire Moon Goddess 
Studio LLC. 
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